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09:01:19 Hi! Good morning, everyone and happy. Friday, where you are just ge�ng started. 

09:01:24 So give it a minute while people are coming into our webinar. 

09:01:27 We want to thank you for atending. This is the first part of our 3 part. 

09:01:32 Theories, we're going to be covering the Ca. 

09:01:36 Twenty-thirty a stakeholder. Engagement, interviews and Insight. 

09:01:41 I'll just give it another 30 seconds, as folks are coming in. 

09:01:54 While we're wai�ng. Can we go to the next slide? 

09:01:57 I'll just go over some housekeeping note. 

09:02:01 So it's webinars being recorded today. All par�cipants are muted during the presenta�on. 

09:02:06 You can use your raise the hand, icon. During our por�on, to request your line to be unmuted, 
to ask a ques�on closed cap�oning, and ASL interpre�ng is available. 

09:02:17 You can access it by clicking the icon at the botom of your zoom screen. 

09:02:22 The is open, so you can submit your ques�ons online or like noted earlier, you can raise your 
hand and we can open your mics during the sec�on. 

09:02:33 And today's presenta�on and recording will be archived. 

09:02:36 You can visit CDA’s YouTube channel to act us. 

09:02:40 Now let's get started. I'd like to turn this over to our director, Susan. 

09:02:45 Tomorrow. 

09:02:46 Thank you very much, Connie, and good morning, everyone. We're so excited to be here today 
at the start of the big reveal of the work that's been happening with our California 2030 ini�a�ve. 

09:03:00 And before we turn it over to the content, I wanted to walk. 

09:03:04 Everyone who's joining us through a �meline of how we arrived at this milestone. 

09:03:12 So we'll go ahead and move to the next slide. 

09:03:15 I think if you're on this call, you're well aware of the demographic shi� that's underway in our 
state. 

09:03:22 But we have some new data that we'd like to share. 



09:03:25 The reason this ini�a�ve is called California, 2030, or Ca, 2030 is the shorthand is to reflect the 
one and 4 Californians will be the age of 60 by the year 2030. 

09:03:42 This effort looks beyond 2030. The Department of Aging will be celebra�ng its fi�ieth 
anniversary next year. 

09:03:51 So we're really looking well beyond 2030, and I wanted to share with you this slide that shows 
where California is headed through the year 2060. 

09:04:02 And you can see here that the under 18 and the 18 to 64 popula�on are experiencing a decline, 
while the 6, 5 popula�on 65 plus popula�on is star�ng, has already started a steep increase next slide 
please, when we look at our aging network our framework of area agents, the 33 area 

09:04:31 agencies on aging we wanted to also share with you how the popula�on is shi�ing in our state 
in terms of where people live, and I think you know, I can't think of any other area where we can site 
increases of 682% and even the 

09:04:52 lowest on this slide the northern and sea area areas are experiencing a 189% increase in the 65 
plus popula�on. 

09:05:02 So this, these demographic trends and facts are really influencing our work as we plan for the 
future. Next slide. 

09:05:13 So this work started years ago in May of 2020, it actually started in 2019 with the Governor's 
execu�ve order for the master plan for aging, and the first deliverable for the master plan for aging was 
the LTSS. 

09:05:29 Subcommitee Report, and in that report stakeholders outline 5 bold objec�ves. 

09:05:35 All of these relate to California 2030, and in par�cular objec�ve number 5, streamlining state 
and local administra�ve structures is one of the objec�ves of California. 

09:05:48 2030 next slide, please. 

09:05:53 The LTSS. Subcommitee report was followed by the Governor's release. 

09:05:57 The official release of the Master plan for aging with 5 bold goals, 23 strategies, and 132 
ini�a�ves. 

09:06:06 In the first round of any ini�a�ves. Ini�a�ve number One. 

09:06:10 Oh! One address! Many of the components of the California 2030 ini�a�ve, and you'll see here 
for those who recall, we've now replaced that ini�a�ve, but it addressed the older Americans act our 
local area maps funding formulas and the 

09:06:30 triple-a designa�ons next slide. Please. 

09:06:34 That sparked intensive work by the Department of Aging in consulta�on with our academic 
partner, Cal. 



09:06:41 State, University, Sacramento, where there was a series of webinars and town halls, and as well 
as solicita�ons of public feedback and leters that were received through the Hubs and Folks Series, and 
in April of last year we shared our findings from that intensive work with 

09:07:02 stakeholders next slide the hubs and folks work shaped our engagement with collabora�ve 
consul�ng, and we took all of that input under. 

09:07:14 Considera�on, and we were thrilled when we were able to enter into a contract with 
collabora�ve consul�ng for a one year contract that started in November of last year. 

09:07:27 Today, we're at about the midpoint, and we'll be unveiling for you today. 

09:07:33 And in July and August the key findings, and more to come on that as well. 

09:07:40 The California 2030 project and the steering commitee that was formed have been directed to 
focus on 6 errors programs and services funding sources and capaci�es. 

09:07:51 Key Performance, measures, governance, geography, and demographics, and branding 
communica�ons and outreach. 

09:08:00 This effort, California, 2030 is focused on the 33 area agencies on aging in our State. 

09:08:08 Next slide. I want to thank all of the members of the California 2030 Steering Commitee. 

09:08:16 We have a key representa�on from leading organiza�ons in our State. 

09:08:21 We have the California Associa�on of Area agencies on aging known as C. 

09:08:26 4 a. We have the California Commission on Aging. We have the California founda�on of for 
independent living Centers. 

09:08:35 The California State Associa�on of Coun�es and the County Welfare Directors Associa�on. 

09:08:41 So each of these organiza�ons submited names. And this is who makes up our steering 
commitee. 

09:08:49 So thank you all for your service and your con�nued service through the end of this year. 

09:08:53 Next slide. 

09:08:56 In January of this year the Governor updated the master plan for aging for the 2023, 2024 
legisla�ve cycle, and we released 95 new ini�a�ves, and I wanted to call aten�on to one ini�a�ve in 
par�cular ini�a�ve 

09:09:16 74 with is the California, 2030 ini�a�ve. 

09:09:21 So the work that we're talking about today is part of a larger context. 

09:09:25 The master plan for aging and a bigger goal area and strategy. 

09:09:30 But you'll see here that we're really proud to be making headway on ini�a�ve 74. 

09:09:37 And there's related work, too. When you look at Goal 3 and strategy F, they're about 4 or 5 
ini�a�ves that relate to this work. 



09:09:44 But this is the specific ini�a�ve that we've been charged to implement next slide. 

09:09:50 Please. 

09:09:52 We're thrilled that the Federal administra�on on community living this month released a no�ce 
of proposed rulemaking, calling for public input for the first �me since 1988 on the older Americans Act. 

09:10:07 So the work that's happening in California, the sense of urgency that we're experiencing, the 
momentum that's building is shared at the Federal level. 

09:10:18 And we're so excited that the work of California 2030 is feeding into our official public 
comments that we will be making and July and August of this year, at the request of the administra�on 
on community living. 

09:10:35 And we're moving into a phase of ac�on and taking all of this input and feedback. 

09:10:42 And using it to make changes and to take ac�on, and next slide. 

09:10:51 Key to the California. 2030 effort. We want to be certain that anything, anything that goes 
forward is person-centered equity focused and data driven. 

09:11:03 And we're delighted that we're able to launch California's first ever community assessment 
survey for older adults. 

09:11:11 This is referred to as CASOA, and we're embarking on that. 

09:11:14 This summer with our triple-a partners and community based organiza�ons throughout the 
State to reach older adults in all 58 coun�es in mul�ple languages and to use the data from the CASOA 
survey also to influence and shape the California 2030 findings and next slide. 

09:11:38 So that walks you through the �meline. The focus today will be on the on the work. 

09:11:45 The stakeholder input from the first wave. But before we move to collabora�ve consul�ng, I 
wanted to invite Michael Costa, a member of our steering commitee and one of the 80 stakeholders 
who was interviewed for this this phase of the work to share a few 

09:12:03 remarks Michael. Welcome. 

09:12:04 Thank you. Susan. It's really great to be here, and II feel honored to have been one of the 
interviewees on this project. 

09:12:15 It's really hard to overes�mate the impact. 

09:12:20 This project can have on the future of aging service delivery in California. 

09:12:27 And to have a focus that really has thought through in a process for gathering informa�on, 
analyzing that informa�on and come up with strategies and recommenda�ons for how we could build an 
integrated a more integrated network of aging service deliveries going forward is really 

09:12:50 though�ul, and Susan is right. A lot of other States are looking at what's going on in California. 



09:12:57 And really looking at for guidance on how you really approach this effort triple A's, of which I 
am the execu�ve director of the Associa�on that represents all 33 area agencies on aging in California, 
we were established 50 years ago, and a lot 

09:13:15 of our Aasa in California are celebra�ng their fi�ieth anniversary this year. 

09:13:20 To really be being kind of the framework of, and the basic superstructure of the aging delivery 
service system and you know, 50 years later, we really need to think through how we do things. 

09:13:36 We've gradually grown in terms of what we do over the �me we do. 

09:13:41 Older Americans act services. We do. Older Californians act services. We're now involved in and 
ge�ng involved in contrac�ng with healthcare. 

09:13:51 But a project like this, which really pulls together informa�on from a wide range of 
stakeholders is really crucial to help form and inform the development of the future networks. 

09:14:06 So I want to thank the department and the governor's also for kind of really providing the 
structure that allows us to think through this in in a good way. 

09:14:18 So thank you, Susan, and your staff, for really pu�ng this together. 

09:14:25 Thank you, Michael, and before I introduce Lori Peterson, who is the execu�ve lead for 
collabora�ve consul�ng, I want to thank the 80 stakeholders who took the �me to be interviewed and to 
contribute to this first phase of work. 

09:14:42 It's a very impressive list of local, regional, state and Federal thought and opinion leaders in the 
aging network. 

09:14:52 So my personal thanks to all of you who contributed to this phase of work. 

09:14:56 And now it is my pleasure to introduce all of you to Lori Peterson, and to thank Lori and her 
extraordinary team for their incredible work. 

09:15:04 They've been fantas�c partners and con�nued to be excellent partners in this work. 

09:15:10 Lori! 

09:15:11 Thank you, Susan, and thank you, Michael, for a few comments. There. 

09:15:16 Good morning, everybody. So our plan today is to we want to offer just a quick view of the 
California 2030 project approach. 

09:15:25 So you kind of see where we are, where we're headed. 

09:15:27 We want to highlight the themes of the stakeholder interviews. 

09:15:31 I think you heard Susan men�oned. This is one of many rounds of engagement and research 
we're conduc�ng, which I'll touch, which I'll spotlight in a moment. 

09:15:41 And then we're going to leave ample �me for par�cipants which thank you for joining this 
morning to ask ques�ons about the stakeholder interviews, but also in general, if you have ques�ons 
about the California 2030 project. 



09:15:56 But before we get started, just a few things I would like for you to keep in mind, so you will hear 
us talk about the California aging network. 

09:16:07 You'll hear us refer to that over and over in this presenta�on, and in the context of California 
2030, that this project, when we say the California aging network, we're talking about the 33 area 
agencies on aging. 

09:16:23 So the 30, three A's and CDA. 

09:16:27 So just a litle context se�ng there. And what we're offering today is only 1 one piece of 
informa�on of research that we've been doing and will be doing throughout the year. 

09:16:41 And what we're going to offer are stakeholder perspec�ves. 

09:16:46 These are not recommenda�ons, these are not commitments at this point in �me. 

09:16:52 This is what we heard from 80 stakeholders that we interviewed over. 

09:16:58 I think early spring. Alright. So with those few disclaimers on the front end, Allison, let's get 
started with the first. 

09:17:07 The first slide. Here. So here's a snapshot of the project design. 

09:17:14 The purpose of California 2030 is to imagine and design a future ready. 

09:17:20 California aging network to serve a larger, older, and more diverse popula�on of older 
Californians. 

09:17:28 To achieve that purpose. We design a year-long project, star�ng with crea�ng the kind of the 
founda�on, and bringing together a steering commitee which Michael's part of, and Susan named off 
several other steering commitee members who have been instrumental in guiding the project and 

09:17:50 offering a very valuable insights and wisdom. 

09:17:53 The project also supports a very robust research and discovery phase. 

09:18:00 And I'm going to spotlight the different phases, the different types of research that we've been 
conduc�ng and we'll con�nue to conduct. 

09:18:07 And then all of this really builds into kind of this last part of the project, where we'll be looking 
at different scenarios or different possibili�es that would need to happen to materialize a future ready 
California aging network. 

09:18:25 And then the final deliverable will be assigned. 

09:18:29 Ac�onable recommenda�ons in those 6 core focus areas that Susan men�oned earlier. 

09:18:35 That's just a kind of a snapshot of the project design and the approach that we have been 
taking. 

09:18:43 And we'll con�nue to take through the rest of this year. 



09:18:45 Next slide you heard me men�on that the project supports a prety robust discovery, and 
research phases of work in here's everything that we've been doing. 

09:18:58 We'll con�nue to do stakeholder perspec�ves, which is the focus of today's webinar in July we 
will go over what we heard from Triple A's. 

09:19:09 So we had the honor to talk to all 33 triple A's and mul�ple people, mul�ple staff members 
within each triple-a. 

09:19:18 So in July, please join us again, because we're going to be going over the stakeholder, those 
stakeholder, the triple-a stakeholder perspec�ves. 

09:19:27 We're doing quite a bit of digging around in data triple. A's. 

09:19:32 And then the CDA data promising prac�ces in August we will have a third webinar where we'll 
feature our promising prac�ces, research, which we're really looking at. 

09:19:43 What can we learn from other States? So the promising prac�ce research is very focused on the 
6 focus areas. 

09:19:50 And it's also looking at what other States are doing and what we need be able to translate back 
over into the State of California. 

09:19:58 And then we're doing trends and projec�ons. And then, as Susan men�oned, the adult older 
adult needs assessment which we are not conduc�ng. 

09:20:06 But we will take that data and incorporate it into our final deliverable next slide, Allison. 

09:20:15 Alright, so again, we are focused on the stakeholder. 

09:20:20 Interview themes this morning. If you are looking at your screen and can see this slide 80. 

09:20:25 We talked to 80 stakeholders, represen�ng a breadth and depth of perspec�ve associa�ons, 
funders, researchers, thought leaders, innovators in aging historians, community based organiza�ons 
and other state government officials. 

09:20:43 So that is, those are the stakeholders we're talking about today. 

09:20:47 And what we wanted to learn from stakeholders of what we asked stakeholders, and 4 key 
categories we wanted to hear their perspec�ve on what's probable and so what are the what are the 
emerging trends that the California aging network needs to be paying 

09:21:07 aten�on to, and why? What challenges and opportuni�es will the California aging network 
face, but also what challenges and opportuni�es will the people that the network serves face? 

09:21:19 And how will desires and needs be shi�ing and changing? 

09:21:23 So we really wanted to get a sense of their perspec�ve on trends which I'm going to highlight in 
a moment. 

09:21:32 We also wanted to hear their perspec�ves on. Well, what's possible? 

09:21:36 So what does a future ready? California aging network look like? 



09:21:43 What would need to change what might stay the same? How would those changes occur who 
needs to change? 

09:21:50 What stakeholders in the system would need to change, what types of programs and policies 
and services would need to be in place to reach those possibili�es. 

09:22:02 The third category was around priori�zing and strategizing. 

09:22:06 So if we're thinking about what's possible, we wanted to hear stakeholders, perspec�ves on, 
what would the priority strategies need to look like both from a strategic perspec�ve, but also from an 
opera�onal point of view, what types of partnerships and alliances would need to be in 

09:22:25 place, and then how would we define success? How would we know that this future, ready 
California aging network is achieving what we intended it to achieve? 

09:22:37 And then finally, we wanted to hear about what are some of the innova�ons that they're seeing 
in the marketplace? 

09:22:45 What are some lessons that they've learned from other ini�a�ves, similar or not similar, and if 
you have an opportunity to read the report once, it's final in the back of the report we listed almost 
every prac�ce innova�on new care and delivery model that we heard from stakeholders 

09:23:07 so the report is also loaded with a ton of resources so highly recommend. 

09:23:11 You, taking a look at the report, if possible. 

09:23:15 And so, as you can imagine, we had a massive amount of interview data, and we had somebody 
on our team who's a very skilled qualita�ve researcher who didn't not conduct any of the interviews. 

09:23:33 We had her go through the interview data, analyze it, synthesize it, and really form kind of 
overarching theme revealed. 

09:23:45 And that trends obviously the current in the future vision which I'll talk just a litle bit about 
ideal traits of a future ready. 

09:23:55 California aging network, and then the ac�on that we'd be needed to achieve this future ready 
California aging network. 

09:24:04 Now, these are just the 4 overarching themes that came out of the interviews. 

09:24:09 There's mul�ple sub themes with that. Each of these big categories. 

09:24:16 Today, we're only going to provide the bullet point version of the themes from the 
interviewees. 

09:24:22 And again I would encourage you. Once the report is made public, to dive into the details a 
litle bit in more detail. 

09:24:30 I'm going to talk about trends and vision, and then I'll turn it over to Jacob, and he'll talk a litle 
bit more about the ideal traits and the ac�on part. 



09:24:41 So here we are, trends. I'm not going to say much about California is becoming older and more 
diverse. 

09:24:47 I think Susan gave some great sta�s�cs, stakeholders not only gave sta�s�cs on this, they also 
talked about just their account so when was talking about looking just looking around at the grocery 
store in the community and this trend definitely being at play, the second was around care needs 

09:25:08 are increasing in complexity, and stakeholders offered pla�orms around the number of people 
with demen�a will con�nue to rise. 

09:25:19 I think mul�ple people with demen�a will con�nue to rise. I think mul�ple people gave the per 
the projec�on around it, doubling by 2040 folks talked about the behavioral health needs and those 
being on the rise for a variety of reasons. 

09:25:33 Social isola�on, lack of support circles, employees of the pandemic. 

09:25:38 They also talked about increasing co-morbidi�es which would lead to more complex care, 
needs the intersec�onality of aging and disability is growing, and stakeholders offered mul�ple op�ons. 

09:25:53 That this might bring for the California aging network in the way that programs and services are 
designed and delivered. 

09:26:01 I should say one thing very quickly again is that not only did stakeholders offer trends, they 
offered their ideas on the implica�ons that these trends would have on the California aging network, and 
that's also included in the report. 

09:26:19 The next there are greater social and health vulnerabili�es, and stakeholders really had quite a 
bit of energy and input around this par�cular theme area there were mul�ple sub themes. 

09:26:34 They talked about older adults experiencing more economic instability and poverty. 

09:26:40 They talked about the severe lack of affordable housing. 

09:26:44 They talked about more homelessness. They also pointed out the extreme weather events 
ge�ng more extreme and naviga�ng. 

09:26:56 Those condi�ons would cause more risk and nega�ve impacts for older Californians. 

09:27:02 So this was an area that's stakeholders had quite a bit of input and energy consumer desires. 

09:27:09 Preferences and needs are evolving a couple things men�oned here, one being around more 
older adults will stay in the workforce longer. 

09:27:19 Some because they want to, because they want to stay engaged, and others because they will 
need to. 

09:27:23 They also talked about that the this next incoming genera�ons will have higher expecta�ons for 
the quality of service and the accessibility of services, including the ability to access services on apps and 
technologies, the elder care and caregiving crisis and challenges are con�nuing to intensify the primary 
thing here was 



09:27:49 or the primary message, I should say, is that the theme around people needing care will 
significantly exceed the available caregiving workforce, and then the integra�on of health and social 
services is growing. 

09:28:06 And most stakeholders sell this as being very beneficial, and that it could produce opportuni�es 
for more partnership across the health and social sector, it could produce opportuni�es for more 
coordinated and a holis�c approach to care and service delivery and most general but I’m sorry 

09:28:27 mostly posi�ve. Around this trend, with the excep�on of many of the stakeholders, were 
concerned about the medicaliza�on of social care. 

09:28:36 As this integra�on con�nues to grow, and then finally, the challenge will not finally, but 
challenges and accessing services will persist, and mostly stakeholders talked about. 

09:28:49 Hey? We need more services and resources and specific regions need more services and 
resources. 

09:28:58 And they talked a lot about the rural communi�es where local hospitals are se�ng down. 
There's a lack of providers, and they really kind of painted a scene where the community-based care 
footprint was not a. 

09:29:19 So if I, before I jump into that last trend, if I was just to step back and kind of do a botom line 
botom line botom line to the trends, I just talked a litle bit about stakeholders forecasted a future 
where demand for age related care and services is going to be high with 

09:29:40 new levels of intensity, the supply to meet that demand will likely be low or lower. 

09:29:49 If we look at the trends in caregiving stress systems of health, ins social care, and the care and 
services that will be available will need to be delivered in a streamlined, integrated manner with more 
specializa�on around areas such as demen�a behavioral health homelessness hey and we'll need to be 

09:30:13 catered to genera�ons that actually don't know a �me when using apps and technology to 
access services existed. 

09:30:21 But as one stakeholder said, we have the ability in California to envision a different future, 
partly because of leadership with the State, and partly because of the aging popula�on, will demand a 
service so stakeholders very much recognize that there is strong public and poli�cal will to prepare 
commit resources 

09:30:47 shi� narra�ves develop new care and service delivery models to serve older and more diverse 
Californians, and this brought them a lot of hope which brings me to another big kind of theme area 
which was around vision. 

09:31:05 And this set of stakeholders encompassed the prety expansive vision of an age friendly 
California. 

09:31:14 So when we asked them about their future versions of a California and their future versions of 
account California aging network, they o�en shared really broad aspects around what successful aging 
would look like in California. 



09:31:33 They express their ideal future for older Californians. They talked a lot about what successful 
aging meant to them. 

09:31:40 Personally, they had lots of ideas on ideal communi�es to live in and inspiring care systems 
available when needed. 

09:31:52 So they talked about older adults living on their own terms, living very meaningful lives, 
affordable housing being very available communi�es that are intergenera�onal and socially connected. 

09:32:07 They also talked about communi�es that are built with density and food and services and 
goods, and create the condi�ons to be around people more o�en, and have that social connec�vity, 
their climate, resilient and emergency ready. 

09:32:24 They envisioned. The whole person. Care system that really focused on longevity, wellness, and 
preven�on. 

09:32:33 And then they imagined an age friendly California. Where long term care is more accessible, 
more affordable. 

09:32:42 And I love this one. Caregiving is considered essen�al for a func�oning society, and paid 
accordingly. 

09:32:50 Now stakeholders acknowledge that some of these aspira�ons were beyond what the 
California aging network could achieve, but they also encouraged the California aging network and the 
stakeholders working on the California 2030 project to really expand our imagina�ons to think about 
what is the 

09:33:14 role? Or what could the role be of the California aging network in crea�ng this future vision of 
an age friendly California? 

09:33:24 So with that, I'm going to pass the baton to Jacob, and he's going to talk a litle bit more about 
the specifics around. 

09:33:32 The ideal traits, and also some of the ac�on that we heard from stakeholders and then we will 
open it up for your ques�ons and comments. 

09:33:41 So, Jacob, over to you. 

09:33:44 Hey? Thank you, Lori, and good morning, everybody. It's nice to visit with you this morning. 

09:33:50 So Lori really covered kind of the external factors that, you know, stakeholders we're seeing for 
California, and we then ask ques�ons about the aging networks specifically. 

09:34:03 And we were first interested in and asking sort of what do they see as the ideal traits of a 
future ready, aging network? 

09:34:13 And then we also asked, what might it take to either strengthen those traits or to build those 
traits over �me? 



09:34:21 So that's what I'll be covering. So first the traits as we, as we listened and gathered informa�on 
from the 80 stakeholders, the trait that really accomplished to the top was around being consumer 
driven and relevant 

09:34:38 what this means is, you know, really understanding the target popula�ons in a more detailed 
way, and also being able to target programs. 

09:34:49 And services to those popula�ons, and be able to account for that meaning, able to 
demonstrate the ability to target, and that the programs and services con�nue to be relevant. 

09:35:02 Which means they may need to evolve or adapt, based on the needs and preferences and 
designs of the popula�ons they're trying to serve. 

09:35:11 The next trait is around being equitable and inclusive. 

09:35:16 Addressing inequali�es, iden�fying how intersec�ng inequali�es impact the popula�ons. 

09:35:23 They're serving. And so, you know, a future ready, aging network sort of looks at its community 
with an Ecuador in an equity lens, but also looks at itself and it's maybe its structure. 

09:35:35 And even the systems that it's in with an equity lens to understand. 

09:35:39 Where are their gaps and barriers in in services? 

09:35:44 The next area is visibility and accessibility. Stakeholders saw an ideal future ready aging 
network being highly visible and easily accessible. 

09:35:56 This is one that is well branded. It's maybe a sort of commonly known from community to 
community, from county to county, and that there is a significant awareness, even if somebody isn't 
necessarily seeking out or looking in the hearing, they're aware that the resource 

09:36:17 exists and they're they know how to get to it. 

09:36:21 The next area is around demonstra�ng consistency, and this is both sort of a combina�on of 
their being a really a standard set of services and ac�vi�es, regardless of where people live. 

09:36:35 So older adults across the state of California have basically a shared ability to access the same 
set of core services delivered through the aging network. 

09:36:47 While there's also a sort of an area where the triple-'s can flex and customized services and 
modali�es to the specifics and nuances of their popula�on, so kind of a combina�on of a greater 
consistency and flexibility the next 

09:37:11 area was serving as a backbone for aging services, and what this really means is sort of this idea 
of a one-stop shop or the one-stop shop for naviga�ng aging resources and accessing aging services 
across California communi�es and that the triple-a's with the triple-a parts of the 

09:37:31 triple-a func�on would be serving as this sort of agnos�c resource. 

09:37:36 For again understanding, naviga�ng, and accessing services and supports, involving aging. 



09:37:45 The sixth area, the sixth trait was around cul�va�ng partnerships, becoming even more 
partnership, driven. 

09:37:53 This is both, I think, on the on the funding side, on the programma�c side and on the advocacy 
side as well. 

09:37:59 A future ready, aging network has strategic partnerships and alliances across those domains, 
and at the local state, and maybe even the na�onal or Federal level. 

09:38:12 And the last area, the last trait that came through was around performance and becoming 
more performance based, focusing more aten�on and energy on the value of the services. 

09:38:26 The value that's being created by these services to each individual, to communi�es, to the 
State as a whole, and really being able to demonstrate that value through understanding and measuring 
outcomes and consumer outcomes. 

09:38:40 And this kind of came up again and again in kind of the just, the picture of the aging network as 
needing to become more data driven, but also as it begins to intersect more with public health and with 
healthcare that are highly data driven and value and outcomes driven that there's a desire 

09:39:00 to see the aging network evolve into also being much more performance-based. 

09:39:06 So now again, those are sort of the high, the high level traits principles, if you will, that these 
stakeholders saw in an ideal future ready, aging network. 

09:39:19 And then this last sec�on is really where we dove in to ac�on. 

09:39:24 So how might, in aging network that is future ready, you know, sort of dial into, or lean into 
those traits to address either the and face the trends, challenges, opportuni�es of the future that Laurie 
had had highlighted 

09:39:45 earlier. So the first area that came through was around addressing the need for change. 

09:39:51 And this is really kind of a combina�on of knowledge and culture and philosophy. 

09:39:57 I think it's what we heard, you know, really an�cipa�ng and preparing for change again, the 
data driven part comes through around. 

09:40:04 Really understanding, not only the numbers of Californians who are aging, aging in place, and 
living longer. 

09:40:15 But what does that mean for the work of the aging network programs and services planning 
advocacy, etc. 

09:40:23 Clarifying organiza�onal goals and the desired role in a changing market. 

09:40:29 So really, understanding again, that sort of strategic posi�on of the aging network of the triple-
a's in this, you know, in this expected future and desired future. 

09:40:40 And then stakeholders also iden�fied their risk of not changing. 



09:40:44 So looking at what happens if there is not a desire for change, or there's not a push for change, 
is that they see the aging network becoming irrelevant or ge�ng lost sort of in other programs and 
services, and even market based opportuni�es that are also trying to meet the needs of older 

09:41:09 adults and the risk of that is also gaps in the system that will inevitably persist. 

09:41:14 That won't be filled again. The stakeholder see the triple A is filling cri�cal gaps in the systems, 
and really being designed that way. 

09:41:22 The next area is around improving workforce capaci�es and capabili�es. 

09:41:27 So again, how do we achieve a future eddy, aging network? 

09:41:30 It is doubling down on workforce development and growth. 

09:41:37 And so these are areas both internal to the aging network, but also external to the systems that 
the aging network works within things like, you know, making careers more atrac�ve and more 
rewarding for folks ensuring that the you know the workforce is aligned with the popula�ons being 

09:41:55 served, meaning that their representa�ve of popula�ons that you know workers understand 
and are culturally aligned with or responsive to the individuals that that they're catering to or working 
with, and that you know that the organiza�ons themselves are desirable workplaces 

09:42:15 for folks. The next area is around fostering greater collabora�on between CDA and the Triple 
A's. 

09:42:28 Oh, I'm sorry! I'm the next area is around assessing local triple-a governance structures and 
what we heard from stakeholders in this area was really the varia�on of Triple A's in terms of service 
offerings or service arrays in terms of resources 

09:42:48 available in terms of impact and influence in their communi�es. 

09:42:53 And they're being in an interest in exploring. 

09:42:59 You know what works and what doesn't work within the different types of governance 
structures. 

09:43:03 And we par�cularly heard folks, you know, explore kind of the pros and cons of the nuances of 
the Triple A's in their different again. 

09:43:13 Scales and orienta�ons to their communi�es. 

09:43:16 And there being a need to really, do you know, a greater assessment and understanding of 
those sort of strengths and challenges, or those pros and cons of different approaches, and iden�fy 
promising prac�ces in that as well the next area is greater collabora�on between Cba and 

09:43:38 the triple A's while we did hear from some stakeholders that you know there is a definitely, a 
renewed effort in the aging world in general to be much more proac�ve and strategic. 

09:43:53 We saw we heard from stakeholders opportuni�es to for CDA and triple A to work together on 
things like reframing, aging, of des�gma�zing, aging both in their own prac�ces, but also as a sort of an 
advocacy opportunity out to the sort of the broader 



09:44:11 environment, advoca�ng for it, you know, increased funding or prac�ce and policy changes that 
are favorable to older adults that make services more. 

09:44:22 Maybe amenable or easily easy to access for older adults, bringing more people into the 
caregiving workforce of the broader aging workforce. 

09:44:34 And, you know, working together on leveraging data, u�lizing and leveraging data to improve 
quality. 

09:44:39 And again, as I said earlier, to demonstrate value back to stakeholders, back to funders. 

09:44:45 Back to taxpayers, back to advocates, and the next area is around diversifying and increasing 
funding sources. 

09:44:57 So again, sort of �ed to some of those advocacy items, stakeholders saw, you know, a future 
ready, aging network, really forging a future that is much more diversified in its funding. 

09:45:11 Not, you know, not only focusing on State and Federal grants and State Federal funding, but 
really becoming more proac�ve on atrac�ng and retaining addi�onal types of funding, including funding 
from healthcare organiza�ons like managed care plans like hospitals and 

09:45:32 clinics. Folks also brought up private pay opportuni�es and sliding scale methods for consumers 
that may be able to afford them, and also sort of renewed efforts on fundraising and grants, par�cularly, 
for you know, innova�ve ideas, or to scale certain programs, or services in joint 

09:45:54 efforts, mul�ple or mul�ple agencies or agencies and department efforts to atract more, more 
public and private grant funding to con�nue to expand, and the last area is it enhancing advocacy 
ac�vi�es stakeholders saw a tremendous opportunity 

09:46:20 for the California aging network to go beyond thinking about policies as they directly impact 
AAAs and CDA in their programs and services. 

09:46:30 And really toward looking out at the consumer experience and becoming more ac�vated 
around the issues that are impac�ng older adults locally and at the State and federal levels. 

09:46:48 So, in addi�on to advoca�ng, for you know, the con�nued growth of the California aging 
network, looking beyond and peripheral to the network building alliances with other advocacy, 
organiza�ons be it from healthcare or public health human services, maybe even the private sector to 
you know 

09:47:11 to build greater awareness, public and poli�cal, about the needs, desires, and interests of older 
adults. 

09:47:22 And the impera�ves of the of the system to really be, and to an�cipate what the future will 
look like. 

09:47:33 And finally, this point is, is also mobilizing all the adults. 

09:47:38 So stakeholders also saw an opportunity for the triple, A's in par�cular, to ac�vate even more. 



09:47:43 So maybe their advisory councils or volunteer bases to also become advocates for older adults 
in their communi�es as well as poten�ally advocates for the California aging network at the at the at the 
State level or even at the Federal level, and that you know the triple a is given 

09:48:00 their deeply embedded role in communi�es also have an opportunity to communicate issues 
locally and add and ac�vate local advocacy. 

09:48:13 Ac�vity. So some of the areas, some of the policy areas that came through in our interviews, 
things like, you know, livable wages for workers and in in the caregiving workforce areas around 
emergency preparedness, health care and service financing, including medical policy or 

09:48:37 future medical policies and opportuni�es to try to bring the Triple A's even more so into the 
medi-cal picture, and then at the Federal level, too, also efforts to align advocacy around. 

09:48:50 You know, favorable changes to the older Americans act, so we certainly invite you to engage 
with the report when it is published, and I believe I'm turning it over to Connie. 

09:49:07 Thank you, Jacob. So now we're going to head into our por�on of today's webinar. 

09:49:13 If you have any ques�ons you can u�lize our box down at the botom of your zoom screen. 

09:49:19 You can type in your ques�on or right now we'll allow some �me for you to click on your raise 
the hand, icon, and we can open your microphones. 

09:49:28 Live to answer your ques�ons, so I'll just give it a quick minute and see if anybody wants to 
raise their hand and answer ques�ons. 

09:49:36 Let's look through the Q. And a box. There are a few ques�ons asking about the report, and 
also the recording. 

09:49:45 Those will be made available. A�er this webinar, so you can. 

09:49:49 There is a page on the CDA homepage under highlight, and you'll see it because the A. 

09:49:56 2030, so we will post the presenta�on and the recording there. 

09:50:00 But we will also have a recap email that goes out to all the atendees as well. 

09:50:05 That will also highlight all the links. So would be. 

09:50:09 I don't think he can raise up. There's one, so I see Leslie Smith. 

09:50:14 We are now going to open your microphone, and you can ask your ques�on. 

09:50:18 Yeah. My ques�on was, there's this very good and very comprehensive and quite exci�ng, but 
one of the things that we tend to do as we age or can do is isolate ourselves rather than 
intergenera�onal. 

09:50:34 And I wondered I didn't see any men�on of that. 

09:50:36 Maybe I missed it, and I apologize, but I'm very concerned that we don't just, you know, kind of 
s�ck older people over there in the corner and say, Okay, we're taking care of them. 



09:50:45 What reality we're, you know, kind of put them on the side. 

09:50:49 So I just don't. What? What is that? 

09:50:51 A major theme, the integra�on intergenera�onal. That's my ques�on. 

09:50:56 Yeah, I thank you. Leslie. Yes, in fact, because we were going so fast I had to breeze over some 
of the parts in in in the vision sec�on. 

09:51:08 But that was a big theme around socially connected communi�es, intergenera�onal crea�ng 
the condi�ons for social connec�on to happen and not just kind of hoping that they do happen and not 
just kind of hoping that they do happen and talking a lot about the stats around social isola�on so there 
was quite 

09:51:27 a bit of commentary around the in the ideal. That's that would need to be a focus. 

09:51:36 And Aaron. I'm also Aaron is joined. 

09:51:38 Our team folks, and she was also heavily involved in not only the interviews, but in working on 
the interview Synthesis, but Aaron feel free to jump in. 

09:51:48 If there's anything that you want to add. 

09:51:52 Leslie. Oh, sorry, Aaron, go ahead! 

09:51:51 Sure. Thank you. Alright. I would just expand on that to say it was. 

09:51:59 You know, the broader vision, but also specific examples and ideas around. 

09:52:03 In a genera�onal programs within the schools or camps or daycare, so that there was certainly 
a lot of good ideas and thoughts around that topic. 

09:52:17 And Leslie does that answer your ques�on? 

09:52:20 And I will. I'll say I know I said this, but I'll just repeat it in in the actual report. 

09:52:27 There's a also a huge amount of appendices included, and we tried to capture almost every 
idea that stakeholders offered us. 

09:52:36 Great. Now I'm encouraged to see that that's across category value that it's going to be worked 
on as a policy and advocacy effort. 

09:52:50 Thank you. 

09:52:55 Oh, come on! It looks like you're talking, but you're on me. 

09:52:57 Sorry thank you, Leslie, for that ques�on. 

09:53:01 If anyone else has any ques�ons, please feel free to click on the raise your hand, icon, at the 
botom of your screen. 

09:53:08 If you have any ques�ons pertaining to what has been presented today again, today is the first 
part of a three-part. 



09:53:16 I have another hand. I see, Ta�ana. We will open your microphone, and you can ask your 
ques�on. 

09:53:23 Thank you. And I put it into the ques�on sec�on on also will the final report address, any 
implementa�on �meframes, and any legisla�ve ac�on that will need to take place to implement those 
sugges�ons? 

09:53:39 I'm going to take one stab. And, Susan, I might turn to you to way into. 

09:53:45 Yes, we did not this report per se. But if you remember, when I gave the kind of the snapshot of 
the project approach, so there's mul�ple waves of kind of research. 

09:53:57 And due diligence, and then we'll be working with the steering commitee to kind of think 
through what are the different scenarios and what are the different possibili�es, and then also working 
with the steering commitee to put forth a set of recommenda�ons ac�onable recommenda�ons that 
would go 

09:54:15 to CDA, and then CDA, Susan, I will let you pick up where I'm leaving off. 

09:54:22 If you wanted to jump in and talk a litle bit more about that. 

09:54:25 Sure. That's exactly right, Lori, and thank you, Ta�ana, for that ques�on. 

09:54:31 So the all of this will be made public and be transparent. 

09:54:36 So in terms of a legisla�ve agenda or regulatory or budget ac�ons. 

09:54:42 I don't think it will be, you know there will be pieces of it. 

09:54:47 That may be picked up. There might be mul�ple opportuni�es, advocates might see something 
in this. 

09:54:54 There's a seize upon the department of Aging might find opportuni�es that we work on across 
the California Health and Human Services Agency. 

09:55:04 But I don't think you will see a big marquee that says this is the legisla�ve agenda and part of 
why, it's �tled California. 

09:55:12 2030 is, we expect, you know, as you heard today, just one sliver of the work. 

09:55:20 Much of this will be unpacked over mul�ple years. 

09:55:30 Okay, I have another Taria Lalia. We're going to unmute you, and you can ask your ques�on. 

09:55:39 Thank you. Tari. Elina. My ques�on is, I contacted my. 

09:55:48 A survey, and I was not able to get much informa�on, although they were aware of it. 

09:55:56 Can you provide a status update on ge�ng the survey out to stakeholders? 

09:56:11 I'm sorry, Tari. I think you were breaking up a litle bit. 

09:56:14 Could you repeat your ques�on again? We couldn't quite catch that. 



09:56:17 We just heard something about a survey. 

09:56:20 Thank you. Can you? Can you hear me? 

09:56:23 Yeah, we can hear you now. 

09:56:25 I'm interested in a status update on the Survey. 

09:56:32 II had heard it was in June, but looks like not. 

09:56:38 Good morning, everyone. My name is Dr. Nakia Thierry, and I am the branch chief for the older 
adults program branch very nice to meet everyone, and very happy to be in atendance today. 

09:56:49 I can provide that status update on the survey so the CASOA needs a session survey is 
scheduled to be released to the public in in July. 

09:57:00 Excuse me, so right now it is with the printer, and we are ge�ng all mailing material prepared, 
and it is going to be going out. 

09:57:09 Our triple-a partners will be receiving all informa�on related to that, and then we will have 
open protec�on. 

09:57:16 Towards the end of July, beginning of August. So please plan on expec�ng that to be released 
very soon, we do an�cipate right now that it should be released in our round. 

09:57:28 Let's say July the second week, second to third week of July. Thank you. 

09:57:33 Thank you. 

09:57:35 Great. Thank you. Nakia, and thank you all for the ques�ons. 

09:57:39 Looking at the clock. We're coming up on �me, so just wanted to wrap this real quickly. 

09:57:46 Thank you again for all your ques�on, Susan, did you want to do the close or Lori? 

09:57:52 I don't worry. Yes. 

09:57:52 Honey we are. We actually have un�l 1015. 

09:57:53 Oh, it's a 1015. Okay? Okay? Sorry. 

09:57:58 So if there's a couple more ques�ons great, if not, we can definitely do a wrap. 

09:58:03 Okay, so let's see if there's any other atendee that have any ques�ons. 

09:58:09 Please feel free to click on the raise your hand, icon, and we will unmute you, and you can ask 
your ques�on. 

09:58:16 Live, going through the. It looked like you s�ll have a quite a few ques�ons to ask about the 
report, and that will be published again. 

09:58:27 You'll see a link off of the CDA home page under highlight. 

09:58:34 Okay. 



09:58:32 It'll face the A. 2030. But we will also recap the links with atendees that atended today's 
webinar as well. 

09:58:43 I don't see any other ques�ons that are related to what has been presented so far. 

09:58:51 Oh, we got one more ques�on here we'll kept. We're going to unmute you, and you can ask 
your ques�ons. 

09:58:58 Good morning. I was wondering about the 80 stakeholders that were interviewed. 

09:59:05 Will their names be in the report? Is that anonymous? 

09:59:09 The reason I ask is, I wonder, about the frame of reference that they come? 

09:59:16 You know, to this conversa�on with, based on where they have lived, where they have worked, 
and whether that's if there's over representa�on of, say, Los Angeles and San Francisco Bay area versus 
Central State, the North State more suburban and rural Coun�es. 

09:59:41 Well, thank you. It's a great ques�on. We are in the process of. 

09:59:49 We have a list of stakeholders that we've included in the back of the report. 

09:59:52 We do need to go back and ask stakeholders if they're okay with their names being listed. 

10:00:00 If they're not okay, what we will do is show like stakeholder category with stakeholder role and 
maybe call out the exact name. 

10:00:11 But we're prety sure that folks will be okay with us lis�ng, lis�ng their name. And we did. 

10:00:17 I didn't men�on this in my comments, but I'll men�on it now. 

10:00:21 Is that we went through a prety he�y stakeholder mapping process, which included working 
with we, you know, went through kind of what are we trying to achieve through the engagement 
process? 

10:00:35 What types of ques�ons do we want? Answered? And then who are the individuals in 
organiza�ons that would be best suited? 

10:00:45 And we worked with CDA mul�ple sessions on mapping those stakeholders. 

10:00:50 We worked with the steering commitee and mapping so, and it kept. 

10:00:56 We kept that list was supposed to be around 50, and it kept ge�ng up, ge�ng up and larger 
and larger. 

10:01:02 So that just a litle backdrop will. 

10:01:04 But thank you for the ques�on, and hopefully, that sa�sfies your ques�on. 

10:01:13 You're welcome. 

10:01:11 Great thanks! 



10:01:16 Okay. Any other ques�ons. Please click on the raise hand icon at the botom of your screens, 
and we can open your microphone. 

10:01:25 And you can ask your ques�on. Live! 

10:01:30 Just give it another minute if there's anyone that would like to ask a ques�on. 

10:01:36 Looking in the I don't see any that are pertaining to exactly what was presented today. 

10:01:44 And again the presenta�on. And today's recording will be posted on a website. 

10:01:49 If anyone needs access to it, go to our homepage under highlights, and you'll see it under the A 
twenty-thirty link. 

10:01:58 Looks like. Do we have a follow-up ques�on from Ta�ana? Can we unmute her, Mike? 

10:02:05 Yes, thank you. It has to do with the CASOA. 

10:02:09 Will the Triple A's get extra supplies in case they want to send some out to people who did not 
receive it? 

10:02:20 So as far as extra supplies there will not be extra supplies given to the triple-a's. 

10:02:27 However, there will be an op�on for open par�cipa�on where a link will be provided if they 
choose to. 

10:02:33 If people choose to par�cipate via the online pla�orm, we do know that some of our triple-a 
partners have indicated that they plan on making copies of the hard copy survey to be distributed. 

10:02:46 But that would be at their discre�on to do so, as far as extra copies being given, there will not 
be extra copies given but there will be the online pla�orm for open par�cipa�on, and those triple A's 
who are choosing to make copies of the hard copy that will be provided to 

10:03:03 Thank you. 

10:03:03 them. Thank you. 

10:03:10 Okay, about one more call for ques�ons. If you have a ques�on, feel free to click on the raise 
hand. 

10:03:19 Icon at the botom of your screen, and we will open your microphone and you can ask your 
ques�on. Live! 

10:03:35 And I'm not seeing any hands being raised so let's go ahead and move. 

10:03:40 Towards concluding what's been presented today, and I'll talk to that over to you, Lori. 

10:03:45 Right. 

10:03:48 Thank you, and I only I just have a couple closing comments, one being. 

10:03:55 Thank you for par�cipa�ng. Thank you for your great ques�ons. I also want to acknowledge 
there's a few Q. 



10:04:02 And a ques�ons that I responded to personally, and we'll make sure you get the informa�on 
that I responded to personally, and we'll make sure you get the informa�on that you're asking for. 

10:04:08 Please join us for the next webinar. I say this with the smile, because the interviews with the 
Triple A's were Jacob and Allison and Aaron and Nathan, that partly they were in the field they visited 
folks in person, and then 

10:04:26 if we couldn't do in person, we did virtual, but we had an opportunity like I said earlier, to talk 
to mul�ple individuals with every triple A in the State of California. 

10:04:37 So the synthesis is rich, and we hope that you'll join us in July. 

10:04:45 It looks like July 20, fourth, same �me. Same place to hear what we're learning from the triple 
A's. 

10:04:51 And with that, Jacob, is there anything else that you would like to say before we sign off? 

10:04:58 No, thank you. 

10:05:00 Okay, Susan, how about from you anything? Before we say goodbye. 

10:05:05 This final thanks to the collabora�ve consul�ng team and to our California 2030 Steering 
Commitee and I failed to men�on that CDA execu�ves have been assigned to each of those 6 areas. 

10:05:19 And we have subject mater experts that are working alongside, collabora�ve consul�ng and 
the steering commitee. 

10:05:26 So my thanks to our Cba staff, as well. 

10:05:30 And we'll see you for the next one in July. 
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